
   
 

   
 

 

 

Welcome to 

Reception R 

Class 2025 - 2026 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



   
 

   
 

When I start school, I will be in 
Reception. 

 
My class will be called Reception R 
and my teacher will be Mrs Ross. 

 
My class teaching assistant will be Mrs 

Jewkes.  

    
 
 
 



   
 

   
 

When I come into school, I will come 
in through the door in the outdoor 

area. I will also go out of this door at 
the end of the day. My adults will be 

there to collect me.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



   
 

   
 

My new classroom looks like this. 
 

 

 
I will have a peg in the corridor to 

hang my coat and bag. My adults at 
home will label all my things. 

 

 
 
 

 



   
 

   
 

There is a trolley in the corridor for 
lunchboxes and water bottles. 

 

 
In my classroom, I will see a visual 

timetable that will help me know what 
I am doing every day. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



   
 

   
 

The toilets are at the end of the 
corridor in Reception. 

 
I will tell an adult when I need to go to 
the toilet, but my teachers will make 
sure we all go to the toilet at snack 
times, break times and lunchtimes. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

I will wash my hands once I have been 
to the toilet. 

 
I know I should not play in the toilets. 



   
 

   
 

At breaktimes and lunchtimes, I will be 
allowed to play outside if it is not 

raining. 

    

I will ask an adult to come inside, if I 
need to use the toilet at breaktime or 

lunchtime and get a toilet pass.  

 
                                                                            

 



   
 

   
 

Sometimes I will be allowed to play on 
the equipment. My teacher will tell 

me when it is my turn. 

    
 

If I hurt myself, I will tell an adult, and 
they will look after me.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



   
 

   
 

At lunchtime, I will eat my lunch in the 
school hall with my class. I can have a 

packed lunch from home or a lunch 
from the school kitchen.  

 

 

 
If I have a lunch from the kitchen, this 

will be chosen for me. 
My teachers will look after me at 

lunch time. 
 



   
 

   
 

I will also go to the school hall for PE 
lessons and sometimes for assemblies.   

 

 
 

Sometimes we may do learning on the 
school field or in the school garden. 

                         
 
 
                        

 



   
 

   
 

If the bell rings and does not stop, this 
is a fire alarm. It means we must leave 

the school building to keep safe.  
The bell is loud, and it might shock me 

when I hear it first. 
 
 

 
 
 

I will listen to my teacher. I will walk 
with my class to the school playground 

and line up quietly. 

 
 



   
 

   
 

In school, there are also other adults 
that I will see.  

  Mrs Fellows  
                                 Head Teacher 

    Mr Allen  
Deputy Head Teacher 

   Miss Nicklin  
Assistant Head Teacher 



   
 

   
 

Sometimes I may need to go to the 
school office for help.  
In the office, I will see 
 

    
                   Mrs Baker       Mrs Lowe 
 
    

   
               Mrs Felton       Mrs Wood 

 



   
 

   
 

I will try and show the school values 
every day. 

• Respect 

• Pride 

• Resilience 

• Independence 

• Challenge 
 
I will try my best to follow the school 

rules. 
 
 

 
 
 



   
 

   
 

I will try and be kind and treat 
everyone as I would like to be treated. 

 

 
I will always try to be ready to learn. 

 

 

 



   
 

   
 

When I follow the rules, adults in 
school will be really pleased with me 

and I will get lots of rewards. 

 

 
 

I will love being in Reception! 
 

I will love it at Brook! 
 


